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MRCA 4-6-11

. ltem X
From; _ . - -
Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2011 3:45 PM Attachment
To:
Subject: Mentryville Roadway Paving Bid Opening Results
Hello,

Nine (9) bids were received by 2pm today, March 22nd, 2011, at the Los Angeles River Center and Gardens, 570 W. Ave.
26, Los Angeles, CA. We opened the bids at 2pm in the following order:

C.A. Rasmussen, Inc. 28548 Livingston Ave. Valencia, CA 91355

Base Bid $ 132,000.00 $ 2.36 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 39,000.00 $ 2.44 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 S 138,000.00 S 2.11/perunit
Bid Alternate 3 $ 314,000.00 $ 2.34 /per unit

Spiess Construction Co., Inc. P.O. Box 2849 Santa Maria, CA 93457

Base Bid $ 117,040.00 S 2.09 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 32,960.00 5 2.06 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 S 134,640.00 S 2.04 /per unit
Bid Alternate 3 $ 460,960.00 §  3.44 /per unit

Mission Paving & Sealing 12747 Schabarum Ave. Irwindale, CA 91706

Base Bid $ 123,200.00 S 2.20 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 34,720.00 S 2.17 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 S 145,200.00 S 2.20/per unit
Bid Alternate 3 No bid No bid

Century Paving inc, 14630 Firestone Blvd. La Mirada, CA 90638

Base Bid $ 100,800.00 S 1.80 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 28,800.00 S 1.80/per unit
Bid Alternate 2 $ 118,800.00 $ 1.80/per unit
Bid Alternate 3 No bid No bid

Lee & Stires, Inc. 634 5. Palmetto Ave. Ontario, CA 91762

Base Bid $ 131,160.00 S 2.15 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 36,037.00 $ 2.10 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 5 146,380.00 S 2.08 /per unit
Bid Alternate 3 No bid No bid

R.C. Becker and Son, Inc. 28355 Kelly Johnson Parkway Santa Clarita, CA 91355

Base Bid S 87,920.00 S 1.57 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 S 30,080.00 S 1.88 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 $ 104,280.00 S 1.58 /per unit
Bid Alternate 3 S 290,780.00 S 2.17
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Commercial Paving & Coating P.0. Box 65557 Los Angeles, CA 90065 MRCA 4-6-11

Base Bid $ 118,000.00 $  2.30 /per unit ltem X

Bid Alternate 1 $  41,600.00 $  2.60 /per unit Attachment
Bid Alternate 2 $ 170,000.00 $  2.60 /per unit '

Bid Alternate 3 $ 425,000.00 $ 3.20 /per unit

California Paving & Grading Co. Inc. 3253 Verdugo Rd. Los Angeles, CA 90065

Base Bid S 119,840.00 S 2.14 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 $ 34,240.00 $ 2.14 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 S 141,240.00 S 2.14 /per unit
Bid Alternate 3 $ 402,000.00 S 3.00 /per unit

NPG Corporation P.0. Box 1515 Perris CA 92571

Base Bid S 149,444.00 S 2.49 /per unit
Bid Alternate 1 $ 48,750.00 $ 3.25 /per unit
Bid Alternate 2 $ 162,000.00 S 2.70 /per unit
Bid Alternate 3 S 518,700.00 S 3.90 /per unit

We will review the submissions to determine the lowest responsible and responsive bidder, and we hope to award the bid
in approximately 1-2 weeks. Thank you again for your participation in our bid process. We will keep you apprised of any
upcoming projects that we might have.




